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About this property
 

We are pleased to offer you this appealing plot of
land situated in a friendly village which belongs to
chanthabouli district, Vientiane capital. It covers
with size –  574 sq. m . The land is included an
unfinished house. It is solidly constructed which
offers bedrooms, bathrooms, kitchen and living area.
However, it needs repair or refreshment to become
cozy house for your family. Furthermore, there is
electricity and water in this plot. The area is suitable
for living and relaxation, thanks to its proximity to
the key point in Vientiane, its unique stunning view
and its developed infrastructure. It is located on the
small road which is accessible and is part of a
developed village.
Within a short distance from the property there are
public facilities. Additionally, the area provides the
following amenities for a pleasant and comfortable
living and entertainment: market, hotel, hospital,
school and restaurant
Viewings
We are ready to organize a viewing of this property
at a time convenient for you. Please contact the
responsible estate agent and inform them when you
would like to have viewings arranged. We can help
you.
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